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THE PROJECT
Our clients approached us with a vision to 
transform their aging concrete marbleised pool 
into a modern place to relax and entertain. 
Their primary goals were to update the curved 
stepped end for a more contemporary design 
and incorporate an automated, in-ground, 
slatted cover for convenience and safety. The 
existing pool featured a large curved stepped 
end, which, while functional, lacked the refined 
look our clients desired. Additionally, the absence 
of an automated cover system meant manual 
effort was required to secure the pool when not 
in use. Our experienced team worked closely 
with the clients to understand their preferences 
and devise a comprehensive renovation plan.

First, we carefully deconstructed the curved 
stepped end, paving the way for a new, 
streamlined design. We then installed an in-
ground slatted cover system, allowing our 
clients to effortlessly open and close the pool 
with the touch of a button. To complement 
the modern updates, we resurfaced the entire 
pool with stunning high-line mosaic tiles in 
a contemporary colour palette. This not only 
elevated the pool’s visual appeal but also 
enhanced its durability and low-maintenance 
properties.
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In addition to the stunning visuals, our 
renovation included a full overhaul of the pool’s 
filtration system, ensuring crystal-clear water 
and optimal energy efficiency for years to come. 
Finally, we replaced the surrounding paving, 
creating a seamless flow between the pool and 
its surroundings, further enhancing the overall 
aesthetic. 

From conception to completion, our team’s 
attention to detail and commitment to quality 
ensured a seamless and stress-free renovation 
process. Our clients now enjoy a truly modern 
pool that not only enhances their outdoor living 
experience but also adds significant value to 
their property.


